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WealthPoint Announces New Business Advisory Partner 
Financial and Business Advisory Firm Expanding in Denver Marketplace 

DENVER, January 8, 2018 – WealthPoint, a leading provider of  business and life insurance advisory 
services with a focus on succession, exit and wealth transfer planning to entrepreneurial family 
groups and affluent clients throughout the U.S., is expanding their Denver office with the hiring of  
Peter Miterko, J.D., its newest Business Advisory Partner. “Bringing Peter to our team enables us to 
expand our business advisory services to the Denver market,” said WealthPoint’s Managing Partner, 
Ryan Barradas. “Peter’s extensive background in the executive compensation and business 
governance sectors will be an excellent resource for our business advisory clients. His reputation and 
experience are second to none and he will allow us to expand our growing business advisory 
practice.” 

Peter is an attorney with more than 20 years’ experience in both executive compensation and 
business governance consulting. In 2015, Peter returned to Denver after working 7 years for the 
New York office of  a global executive compensation consulting firm. Peter has consulted to more 
than 150 compensation committees of  public, privately held, and not for profit organizations, and 
he has taken on numerous assignments for management, as well. His core belief  and determination 
to put his client’s needs first, are directly aligned with WealthPoint’s mantra, Know your story™.  

“I’m eagerly looking forward to joining the WealthPoint team,” says Peter. “I’m excited to join a firm 
that has the dedicated staff  and best practices and processes in place to allow me to deliver 
tremendous value to our entrepreneurial and affluent clientele.” 

About WealthPoint 

WealthPoint is headquartered in Phoenix, Arizona and specializes in providing a holistic approach to 
business and life insurance advisory services with a focus on succession, exit and wealth transfer 
planning. WealthPoint serves affluent individuals, family groups and middle-market, family-owned 
and closely held companies throughout the United States. The company’s unique process combines 
thorough discovery, collaborative and flexible solutions, and an unbridled commitment to 
implementation and on-going support. More information is available at www.wealthpoint.net. 
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